Organizati BSRC Joint Purchasing Council

Event Number FY2023-Paper Spring
Event Title Computer-Copier Paper Workgrou Purchasing
Event Description NOTICE TO BIDDER: Bi-State Joint Purchasing Council i Event Owr Bryan Schmid
Event Type Sealed Bid Email bschmid@bistateonline.org
Issue Date 1/27/2023 02:00:01 PM (CT) Phone 1(309) 7936300 x1123
Close Date 2/16/2023 02:00:00 PM (CT) Fax
Garvey's Office Products PAPER101 (THE PAPER CORPORA idland Paper Company Offi ess Office Products
Total Price| $7,264.00]  Total Price| $8,341.00]  Total Price| $9,058.00]  Total Price| $9,064.00
Line#  Description Qry UOoOM Estimated | Cost per 1,000 | nded Cost per 1,000 | ded Cost per 1,000 | Extended Cost per 1,000 | ded
1 8-1/2" x 11", 20#, white, xerographic paper, #4 quality, long grain, 92 brightness min.(No recycled 610,000 Sheets $10.60 $6,466.00 $8.50 $5,185.00 $11.80 $7,198.00 $8.80 $5,368.00
2 8-1/2" x 11", 20#, white, 100%recycled, 30% post consumer, #4 quality, 92 brightness min.FSC 115,000 Sheets No Bid $9.20 $1,058.00 $12.40 $1,426.00 $11.20 $1,288.00
3 8-1/2" x 11", 20#, white, 100% recycled, 50% post consumer, #4 quality, 92 brightness minimum. 75,000 Sheets No Bid $9.20 $690.00(No Bid $11.20 $840.00
4 8-1/2" x 11", 20#, white, 100% recycled, 100% post consumer, #4 quality, 92 brightness minimum. 80,000 Sheets No Bid 9.20 $736.00(No Bid $11.20 $896.00
5 11" x 17", 20# white, xerographic paper, #4 quality, long grain, 92 brightness minimum 35,000 Sheets $22.80 $798.00 $19.20 $672.00 $12.40 $434.00 $19.20 $672.00
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