Joint Purchasing Council - 2023 Turf Chemicals and Seed Final Bid Tabulation
| 1 |Herbicides |

| 2 |RoundUp Weathermax Herbicide |

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
[ALT2] River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 325 gallon $34.48 $11,206.00 Ranger Pro 41% Bayer
[ALT1] C.D. Ford and Sons Inc. 325 gallon $38.00 $12,350.00 Killzall 41% Glyphosate Hi-Yield
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 325 gallon $39.55 $12,853.75 Roundup Pro Concentrate
[ALT1] Van Diest Supply Company 325 gallon $42.25 $13,731.25 RoundUp Pro Concentrate Bayer
[ALT1] River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 325 gallon $44.79 $14,556.75 Roundup Pro Concentrate 50.2% Bayer
[ALT1] Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 325 gallon $48.35 $15,713.75 RoundUp Customa.i.,Glyphosate, N-(phosphonomethyl)glycine, in the form of its isc Bayer
Van Diest Supply Company 325 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 325 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 325 gallon No Bid
| 3 |Casoron G-4
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 10 bag $142.50 $1,425.00
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 10 bag $154.50 $1,545.00 Fine or coarse grade is same price
[ALT1] Van Diest Supply Company 20 bag $82.50 $1,650.00 Casoron 4G - 25 Ib bag OHP
Van Diest Supply Company 10 bag No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 10 bag No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 10 bag No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 10 bag No Bid
[ 4 Trreflan TR-10
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 23 bag $33.20 $763.60 Treflan 5 G, 40 |b bag
[ALT1] Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 29 bag $29.20 $846.80 Treflan TR-10a.i.. Trifluralin: - 10%; Inert ingredients - 90%; 40 |b bag
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 23 bag $62.00 $1,426.00
Van Diest Supply Company 23 bag No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 23 bag No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 23 bag No Bid
| 5 |ProDeuce
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 80 gallon $121.00 $9,680.00 Surmise Speedpro XT, Rate:3.2 to 6.40z per gallon.
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 80 gallon No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 80 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 80 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 80 gallon No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 80 gallon No Bid
| 6 |Vesse|
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Van Diest Supply Company 155 gallon $25.60 $3,968.00
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 155  gallon $25.88 $4,011.40
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 155 gallon $27.25 $4,223.75 Triad Select 2x2.5 gal
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 155  gallon $32.06 $4,969.30
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 155 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 155 gallon No Bid
| 7 |Aquamaster
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
[ALT1] Van Diest Supply Company 30 gallon $36.60 $1,098.00 Aquaneat Nufarm
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 30 gallon $43.50 $1,305.00 Roundup Custom
[ALT1] Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 30 gallon $48.35 $1,450.50 RoundUp Customa.i.,Glyphosate, N-(phosphonomethyl)glycine, in the form of its isc
Van Diest Supply Company 30 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 30 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 30 gallon No Bid
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| 8 |Aquasweep

Supplier QTY UoOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 15 gallon $55.40 $831.00
Van Diest Supply Company 15 gallon $58.45 $876.75
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 15 gallon $65.00 $975.00
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 15 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 15 gallon No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 15 gallon No Bid
| 9 |QuickSiIver T&0
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 3 pint $159.50 $478.50 Quicksilver is an 80z bottle and | priced by the 8 oz bottle
[ALT1] Van Diest Supply Company 6 8 oz Bottle $132.65 $795.90 Quicksilver FMC
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 3 pint $378.70 $1,136.10 Ours comes in a 80z container
[ALT1] Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 6 8oz $189.35 $1,136.10 Quicksilver T&O - 8oz, Carfentrazone - 21.3%; Other ingredients - 78.7% FMC
[ALT1] Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 6 80z. conta $189.71 $1,138.26 QuickSilver T&080z. Container FMC
Van Diest Supply Company 3 pint No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 3 pint No Bid
| 10 |Barricade 4FL
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
[ALT1] Van Diest Supply Company 30 gallon $69.90 $2,097.00 Resolute 4FL Syngenta
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 30 gallon $72.33 $2,169.90 Resolute Flo
[ALT1] River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 30 gallon $115.00 $3,450.00 Prodiamine 4L
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 30 gallon $127.88 $3,836.40
[ALT1] Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 30 gallon $127.88 $3,836.40 ARMORTECH KADE 4L - 2.5 GAL, Prodiamine 40.7% United Turf Allianc
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 30 gallon $157.00 $4,710.00
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 30 gallon No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 30 gallon No Bid
| 11 |Tordon RTU Herbicide 2
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 1 quart $13.40 $13.40
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 1 quart $16.90 $16.90
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 1 quart $19.21 $19.21
C.D. Ford and Sons Inc. 1 quart $22.48 $22.48
Van Diest Supply Company 1 quart No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 1 quart No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 1 quart No Bid
| 12 |Reward
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
[ALT1] D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 20 gallon $57.40 $1,148.00 Tribune 2 x2 1/2 Syngenta Tribune 2.5
[ALT1] Van Diest Supply Company 20 gallon $62.80 $1,256.00 Tribune Herbicide Syngenta
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 20 gallon $85.76 $1,715.20
[ALT1] Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 20 gallon $85.76 $1,715.20 Diquat Herbicide - 1 Gal, Diquat - 37.3%; Other Ingredients - 62.7% Nufarm
[ALT1] River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 20 gallon $92.00 $1,840.00 Diquat 37.3%
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 20 gallon $96.00 $1,920.00
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 20 gallon No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 20 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 20 gallon No Bid
| 13 |Spectic|e Flo
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 2 bottle $275.00 $550.00
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 2 bottle $280.62 $561.24
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 2 bottle $280.62 $561.24
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 2 bottle No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 2 bottle No Bid

| 14 |Mi|lennium Ultra ll
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Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 1 case $466.00 $466.00
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 1 case $466.00 $466.00
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 1 case $466.00 $466.00 $93.20 gal
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 1 case $502.98 $502.98
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 1 case No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 1 case No Bid
| 15 |Pylex
Supplier QTY UoOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 1 container $312.00 $312.00 Pylex is packaged in 4 oz bottles, $ 312.00 per 4 oz
Van Diest Supply Company 1 container No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 1 container No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 1 container No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 1 container No Bid
| 16 |Misce|laneous Iltems |
| 17 |Pond Colorant WSP |
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 4 case $87.40 $349.60 AquaBlue Select WSB
[ALT1] Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 7 case $60.56 $423.92 Precision Labs True Blue - 6x5.25 oz/case Precision Labs
[ALT1] C.D. Ford and Sons Inc. 4 case $106.28 $425.12 Aqua Blue Select WSB 10x40z. Prime Source
Van Diest Supply Company 4 case No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 4 case No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 4 case No Bid
| 18 |Trinexapac-ethyl -11.3%
Supplier QTY UoOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 65 gallon $92.40 $6,006.00 Trin Pac 1 gallon
Van Diest Supply Company 65 gallon $102.15 $6,639.75
[ALT1] Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 65 gallon $111.58 $7,252.70 Trinexapac-ethyl- 12%, 2.5 gallon container Quali-Pro
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 65 gallon $113.00 $7,345.00
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 65 gallon $121.70 $7,910.50 Ours comes in a 2.5 gal for our best price
[ALT1] Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 65 gallon $121.70 $7,910.50 ARMORTECH PGR 113 - 2.5 Gal, Trinexapac-ethyl (CAS No.: 95266-40-3) 11.3% United Turf Allianc
C.D. Ford and Sons Inc. 65 gallon $134.69 $8,754.85
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 65 gallon No Bid
[ 19 JLining chalk
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
C.D. Ford and Sons Inc. 676 bag $5.00 $3,380.00
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 676  bag $5.18 $3,501.68 Louisville Slugger Marking Chalk
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 676 bag $5.24 $3,542.24
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 676  bag No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 676 bag No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 676 bag No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 676 bag No Bid
| 20 |Turface Quick Dry/Turface Game Saver
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
C.D. Ford and Sons Inc. 80 bag $9.50 $760.00
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 80 bag $10.65 $852.00 Turface Quick Dry
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 80 bag No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 80 bag No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 80 bag No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 80 bag No Bid
| 21 |Proxy Growth Regulator
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
[ALT1] River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 35 gallon $19.85 $694.75 Verve Growth Regulator 2x 2.5 gal
[ALT1] Van Diest Supply Company 35 gallon $22.60 $791.00 Ethephon 2SL Quail Pro
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[ALT1] Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 35 gallon $29.60 $1,036.00 ai- Ethephon [(2-chloroethyl)-phosphonic acid]- 21.7%; 2.5 gallon container Quali-Pro
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 35 gallon $32.40 $1,134.00
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 35 gallon $34.44 $1,205.40
[ALT1] Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 35 gallon $34.44 $1,205.40 ETHEPHON 2SL - 2.5 Gal, Ethephon [(2-chloroethyl)phosphoric acid] - 21.7% Quali-Pro
Van Diest Supply Company 35 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 35 gallon No Bid
[ 22 Trlex-A-clay
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 40 bag $13.75 $550.00 SAF 5 Star clay
C.D. Ford and Sons Inc. 40 bag $13.90 $556.00
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 40 bag No Bid
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 40 bag No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 40 bag No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 40 bag No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 40 bag No Bid
| 23 |Liquid Tank Cleaner
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
C.D. Ford and Sons Inc. 4 case $120.00 $480.00
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 4 case $144.00 $576.00
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 4 case $148.70 $594.80
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 4 case $193.56 $774.24
[ALT1] Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 4 case $193.56 $774.24 Erase Spray System Cleaner - Quart Precision Labs
Van Diest Supply Company 4 case No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 4 case No Bid
| 24 |Shakedown
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 84 quart $9.30 $781.20
[ALT1] C.D. Ford and Sons Inc. 84 quart $14.00 $1,176.00 Defoamer Select Prime Source
[ALT1] Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 84 quart $14.63 $1,228.92 Knockdown- As Specified Precision Labs
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 84 quart $20.86 $1,752.24
[ALT1] Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 84 quart $20.86 $1,752.24 Knockdown Antifoaming Agent - Quart Precision Labs
Van Diest Supply Company 84 quart No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 84 quart No Bid
| 25 |Non-lonic Surfactant
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Van Diest Supply Company 17.5 gallon $13.95 $244.13
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 17.5 gallon $14.98 $262.15 FS Aqualight non-ionic surfactant
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 17.5 gallon $17.30 $302.75
C.D. Ford and Sons Inc. 17.5 gallon $22.00 $385.00 Prime Source 80/20 Select 2x2.5gallon
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 17.5 gallon $26.14 $457.45
[ALT1] Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 17.5 gallon $26.14 $457.45 Chem-Stik LPH Non lonic spreader sticker and pH Buffer- 2.5 Gal Precision Labs
[ALT1] Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 18 gallon $51.09 $919.62 Non-lonic Surfactant- 1 gallon container Precision Labs
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 17.5 gallon No Bid
[ 26 [captain xTR
Supplier QTY UoOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 15 gallon $30.20 $453.00
Van Diest Supply Company 15 gallon $33.80 $507.00
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 15 gallon $37.27 $559.05
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 15 gallon $44.30 $664.50
C.D. Ford and Sons Inc. 15 gallon $44.50 $667.50
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 15 gallon No Bid
| 27 |Cornbelt (foamer)
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Van Diest Supply Company 4 gallon $24.62 $98.48
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 4 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 4 gallon No Bid
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Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 4 gallon No Bid
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 4 gallon No Bid
[ 28 [Brandt Indicate 5
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 11 gallon $48.50 $533.50
Van Diest Supply Company 11 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 11 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 11 gallon No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 11 gallon No Bid
[ 29 Jcutrine - Plus Algaecide/herbicide
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Van Diest Supply Company 20 gallon $25.45 $509.00
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 20 gallon $28.30 $566.00
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 20 gallon $30.40 $608.00
C.D. Ford and Sons Inc. 20 gallon $37.86 $757.20
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 20 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 20 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 20 gallon No Bid
[ 30 [clay Bricks
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 38 bag $14.20 $539.60
C.D. Ford and Sons Inc. 38 bag $14.50 $551.00
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 38 bag $17.50 $665.00 Turface mound master bricks - red (304 bricks/pallet)
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 38 bag No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 38 bag No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 38 bag No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 38 bag No Bid
[ 31 [rurftech BioMega
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 16 Ib $79.75 $1,276.00
Van Diest Supply Company 16 Ib No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 16 b No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 16 b No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 16 Ib No Bid
| 32 |Turftech Bio
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 8 b $209.75 $1,678.00
Van Diest Supply Company 8 b No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 8 lb No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 8 Ib No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 8 Ib No Bid
[ 33 [rurftech Thatch Relief
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 15 gallon $48.00 $720.00
Van Diest Supply Company 15 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 15 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 15 gallon No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 15 gallon No Bid
[ 34 Jrioratine Eon 75
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 6 bag $90.00 $540.00
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 6 bag No Bid
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 6 bag No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 6 bag No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 6 bag No Bid
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| 35 |Floratine Maxiplex

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 5 gallon $35.00 $175.00
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 5 gallon No Bid
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 5 gallon No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 5 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 5 gallon No Bid
| 36 |Fungicide |
| 37 |Iprodione 2SE |
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
[ALT1] Van Diest Supply Company 230 gallon $60.14 $13,832.20 Ipro 2 Quali Pro
[ALT1] Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 230 gallon $60.64 $13,947.20 Chipco 26019- As Specified Bayer
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 230 gallon $64.20 $14,766.00
[ALT1] C.D. Ford and Sons Inc. 230 gallon $66.41 $15,274.30 Iprodione 2F Select 2x2.5gallon Prime Source
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 230 gallon $67.00 $15,410.00
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 230 gallon $90.58 $20,833.40
[ALT1] Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 230 gallon $90.58 $20,833.40 Armortech IP 238 - 2.5 Gal, Iprodione:3-(3,5-dichlorophenyl)-N-(1-methylethyl)-2,4- United Turf Allianc
Van Diest Supply Company 230 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 230 gallon No Bid
| 38 |Subdue MAXX Fungicide
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
[ALT1] Van Diest Supply Company 1 gallon $300.95 $300.95 Mefenaxom 2 AQ Quali Pro
[ALT1] River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 1 gallon $372.00 $372.00 Mefenoxam2
[ALT1] Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 1 gallon $408.81 $408.81 Mefenoxam 2AQ- As Specified Quali-Pro
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 1 gallon $460.71 $460.71
[ALT1] Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 1 gallon $460.71 $460.71 MEFENOXAM AQ - 1 Gal, Mefenoxam*: (R)-2-[(2,6-dimethylphenyl) methoxyacetyl: Quali-Pro
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 1 gallon $582.00 $582.00
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 1 gallon $582.00 $582.00
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 1 gallon No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 1 gallon No Bid
| 39 |Chlorotha|oni|
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Van Diest Supply Company 180 gallon $26.15 $4,707.00
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 180 gallon $26.58 $4,784.40
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 180 gallon $31.75 $5,715.00
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 180 gallon $32.50 $5,850.00
C.D. Ford and Sons Inc. 180 gallon $35.58 $6,404.40
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 180 gallon $50.00 $9,000.00
[ALT1] Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 180 gallon $50.00 $9,000.00 Armortech CLT 720 FL- 2.5 gal, Chlorothalonil (tetrachloroisophthalonitrile) 54.0%  United Turf Allianc
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 180 gallon No Bid
| 40 |Propiconazo|e
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Van Diest Supply Company 70 gallon $60.08 $4,205.60
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 70 gallon $71.40 $4,998.00
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 70 gallon $74.70 $5,229.00
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 70 gallon $79.00 $5,530.00
C.D. Ford and Sons Inc. 70 gallon $80.30 $5,621.00
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 70 gallon $89.12 $6,238.40
[ALT1] Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 70 gallon $89.12 $6,238.40 Armortech PPZ 143 MC - 2.5 gal, Propiconazole 14.3% United Turf Allianc
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 70 gallon No Bid
| 41 |Propamocarb
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 1 gallon $305.88 $305.88
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 1 gallon $315.00 $315.00
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Van Diest Supply Company 1 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 1 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 1 gallon No Bid
[ 42 [ree-offa.5F
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
[ALT1] D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 175 gallon $45.60 $7,980.00 Prokoz Transom 4.5 F Nufarm Transom
[ALT1] Van Diest Supply Company 175  gallon $48.95 $8,566.25 TM 4.5 Quali Pro
[ALT1] Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 175 gallon $53.84 $9,422.00 Transom 4.5F - As Specified Prokoz
[ALT1] River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 175  gallon $59.00 $10,325.00 TM 4.5 select
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 175 gallon $59.32 $10,381.00
[ALT1] Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 175  gallon $59.32 $10,381.00 ARMORTECH TM 462 - 2.5 gal, Thiophanate-methyl 46.2% United Turf Allianc
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 175 gallon No Bid
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 175 gallon No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 175 gallon No Bid
| 43 |Phosphite Program
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Van Diest Supply Company 80 gallon $28.40 $2,272.00
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 80 gallon $30.25 $2,420.00
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 80 gallon $34.40 $2,752.00
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 80 gallon $43.16 $3,452.80
[ALT1] Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 80 gallon $43.16 $3,452.80 ARMORTECH 28 - 2.5 gal, United Turf Allianc
[ALT1] C.D. Ford and Sons Inc. 80 gallon $49.50 $3,960.00 Select Phite 0-0-26 Prime Source
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 80 gallon $55.00 $4,400.00
| 44 |Ignition Power Phyte
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 6 container $6,125.00 $36,750.00 PK Fight 125 Gallon 1-20z/1000 on Fairway height grass
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 6 container $7,425.00 $44,550.00
Van Diest Supply Company 6 container No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 6 container No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 6 container No Bid
| 45 |Tebuconozo|e
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
[ALT1] Van Diest Supply Company 80 gallon $61.73 $4,938.40 Tebuconazole 3.6F - 1 gallon container Quali Pro
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 80 gallon $63.04 $5,043.20 We supply this in a 1 gallon container.
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 80 gallon $67.40 $5,392.00
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 80 gallon $69.00 $5,520.00
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 80 gallon $85.00 $6,800.00
[ALT1] Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 80 gallon $85.00 $6,800.00 Armortech Teb 360 - 1 gal, Tebuconazole: alpha-[2-(4-chlorophenyl)ethyl]-alpha-(1, United Turf Allianc
Van Diest Supply Company 80 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 80 gallon No Bid
| 46 |Fluazinam 40%
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 27.5 gallon $248.20 $6,825.50
[ALT1] Van Diest Supply Company 28 gallon $265.70 $7,439.60 Flex-Guard
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 27.5 gallon $295.00 $8,112.50
[ALT1] Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 28 gallon $290.48 $8,133.44 Fluazinam 40%- We supply this in a 1 gallon container. Quali-Pro
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 27.5 gallon $363.03 $9,983.33 Ours comes in a 1 Gallon container and would have to provide 28 containers to covt
[ALT1] Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 28 gallon $363.03 $10,164.84 Armortech Rotator - 1 gal, Fluazinam: 3-chloro-N-[3-chloro-2,6-dinitro-4-trifl uorom United Turf Allianc
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 27.5 gallon No Bid
| 47 |Azoxystrobin
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 1 gallon $160.00 $160.00
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 1 gallon $215.00 $215.00
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 1 gallon $220.00 $220.00
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 1 gallon $361.34 $361.34
[ALT1] Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 1 gallon $361.34 $361.34 ARMORTECH ZOXY 2F - 1 gal, Azoxystrobin: methyl (E)-2-{2-[6-(2-cyanophenoxy)pyr United Turf Allianc
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Van Diest Supply Company 1 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 1 gallon No Bid
| 48 |Insecticide |
| 49 |Scimitar GC Insecticide |
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Van Diest Supply Company 4 quart $145.34 $581.36
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 4 quart $157.00 $628.00
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 4 quart $165.26 $661.04
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 4 quart No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 4 quart No Bid
| 50 |Acelepryn
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 2 oz $1,137.50 $2,275.00 This is the price per 64 oz bottle
Van Diest Supply Company 2 oz $1,137.50 $2,275.00
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 2 oz $1,137.50 $2,275.00
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 2 oz No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 2 oz No Bid
| 51 |Wetting Agents |
[ 52 Jrricure AD |
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 1 drum $2,346.00 $2,346.00
Van Diest Supply Company 1 drum No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 1 drum No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 1 drum No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 1 drum No Bid
| 53 |Plant Food Flo-Thru A+ Penetrant & Bicarbonate Reducer
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 22.5 gallon $63.00 $1,417.50
Van Diest Supply Company 22.5 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 22.5 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 22.5 gallon No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 22.5 gallon No Bid
| 54 |Plant Food Hydration A+ Plant & Soil Hydrating Agent & Bicarbonate Reducer
Supplier QTY UoOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 40 gallon $116.00 $4,640.00
Van Diest Supply Company 40 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 40 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 40 gallon No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 40 gallon No Bid
| 55 |Ferti|izer |
[ 56 [25-5-15 |
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
[ALT1] River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 360 bag $22.90 $8,244.00 25-0-5 50%EPEC, 2%fe
C.D. Ford and Sons Inc. 360 bag $26.34 $9,482.40
Van Diest Supply Company 360 bag $26.85 $9,666.00
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 360 bag $27.75 $9,990.00
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 360 bag $27.80 $10,008.00
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 360 bag No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 360 bag No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 360 bag No Bid
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[ 57 JAnderson's AGC 32-3-5

Supplier QTY UoOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 100 bag $34.20 $3,420.00
Van Diest Supply Company 100 bag No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 100 bag No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 100 bag No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 100 bag No Bid
| 58 JAnderson's AGC 24-4-12
Supplier QTY UoOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 60 bag $34.40 $2,064.00
Van Diest Supply Company 60 bag No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 60 bag No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 60 bag No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 60 bag No Bid
[ 59 Tknife Plus
Supplier QTY UoOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 5 gallon $52.00 $260.00
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 5 gallon No Bid
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 5 gallon No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 5 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 5 gallon No Bid
| 60 |CapHIex
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 5 gallon $50.00 $250.00
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 5 gallon No Bid
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 5 gallon No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 5 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 5 gallon No Bid
[ 61 [Anderson 17-0-4
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 100 bag $26.30 $2,630.00
[ALT1] River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 100 bag $28.75 $2,875.00 18-0-6 25% EPEC60, .19 Dimension EC Grow
Van Diest Supply Company 100 bag No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 100 bag No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 100 bag No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 100 bag No Bid
| 62 JurLEXx 46-00-00
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 40 bag $34.10 $1,364.00
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 40 bag $38.94 $1,557.60
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 40 bag $39.53 $1,581.20
Van Diest Supply Company 40 bag No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 40 bag No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 40 bag No Bid
| 63 [21-0-4 w/ 100% Merit
Supplier QTY UOoOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
[ALT1] River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 195 bag $26.50 $5,167.50 21-0-0 40% EPEC60, .2 merit EC grow
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 195 bag $27.55 $5,372.25
Van Diest Supply Company 195 bag $29.55 $5,762.25
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 195 bag No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 195 bag No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 195 bag No Bid
| ‘64 [Foliar Pak 14-2-4 |
Supplier QTY UoOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
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Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 100 gallon $37.88 $3,788.00
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 100 gallon No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 100 gallon No Bid
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 100 gallon No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 100 gallon No Bid
| 65 |Glycofuse
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 5 gallon $50.00 $250.00
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 5 gallon No Bid
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 5 gallon No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 5 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 5 gallon No Bid
| 66 |Perkup
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 5 gallon $88.00 $440.00
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 5 gallon No Bid
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 5 gallon No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 5 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 5 gallon No Bid
| 67 |Protesyn
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 5 gallon $53.00 $265.00
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 5 gallon No Bid
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 5 gallon No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 5 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 5 gallon No Bid
[ 68 [18-a-24
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
C.D. Ford and Sons Inc. 20 bag $36.34 $726.80
[ALT1] River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 20 bag $43.90 $878.00 18-4-18 50% Nutralene, SOP + Micros- Greens grade
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 20 bag No Bid
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 20 bag No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 20 bag No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 20 bag No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 20 bag No Bid
| ‘69 JRusty's 2-0-1 Plant Food
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 5 gallon $168.50 $842.50
Van Diest Supply Company 5 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 5 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 5 gallon No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 5 gallon No Bid
[ 70 [18-3-4 Plant Food
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 5 gallon $40.30 $201.50
Van Diest Supply Company 5 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 5 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 5 gallon No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 5 gallon No Bid
| 71 |Plant Food 12 iron
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 20 gallon $30.80 $616.00
Van Diest Supply Company 20 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 20 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 20 gallon No Bid
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Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 20 gallon No Bid
[ 72 Tpiant Food 4-20-22
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 20 gallon $60.50 $1,210.00
Van Diest Supply Company 20 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 20 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 20 gallon No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 20 gallon No Bid
[ 73 |plant Food Kelplant 1-0-1
Supplier QTY UoOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 5 gallon $101.80 $509.00
Van Diest Supply Company 5 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 5 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 5 gallon No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 5 gallon No Bid
| 74 |Plant Food Adams Earth Biostimulant
Supplier QTY UOoM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 20 gallon $79.50 $1,590.00
Van Diest Supply Company 20 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 20 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 20 gallon No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 20 gallon No Bid
| 75 |Plant Food Green-T Micro Mix Glucoheptonate Chelate
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 10 gallon $51.10 $511.00
Van Diest Supply Company 10 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 10 gallon No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 10 gallon No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 10 gallon No Bid
| 76 |Floratine Defense Man
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 1 pail $576.00 $576.00
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 1 pail No Bid
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 1 pail No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 1 pail No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 1 pail No Bid
| 77 |X-factor
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 5 gallon $38.00 $190.00
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 5 gallon No Bid
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 5 gallon No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 5 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 5 gallon No Bid
[ 78 Iright's on
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 5 gallon $60.00 $300.00
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 5 gallon No Bid
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 5 gallon No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 5 gallon No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 5 gallon No Bid
[ 79 JePEC 3 Month
Supplier QTY UoOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 160 bag $75.40 $12,064.00
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 160 bag $75.40 $12,064.00

FY2023-Turf Chem-Seed - Page 11



Van Diest Supply Company 160 bag No Bid

Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 160 bag No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 160 bag No Bid
Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 160 bag No Bid

[ 80 [EPEC 6 Month

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes Manufacturer Manufacturer #
D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 160 bag $82.40 $13,184.00

River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 160 bag $82.40 $13,184.00

Van Diest Supply Company 160 bag No Bid

Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 160 bag No Bid

Midwest Turf Support, LLC 160 bag No Bid

Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 160 bag No Bid

| 81 |Kentucky Bluegrass/Rye Grass Seed 70/30

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
United Seeds Inc. 950 Ib $2.95 $2,802.50 Seed will be Blue Tag Certified. Cultivars to be used in mix are: Jackpot, Navy, and Vi

[ALT1] River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 950 Ib $3.09 $2,935.50 Supreme 60/40 blend

[ALT1] Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 950 Ib $3.15 $2,992.50 Kentucky Bluegrass/Rye Grass Seed 80/20 Varieties:55% ASHLAND KBG 15% APPAL Vista Seed Partnel

River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 950 Ib $3.24 $3,078.00 70/30 blend

C.D. Ford and Sons Inc. 950 Ib $3.30 $3,135.00

D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 950 Ib No Bid

Van Diest Supply Company 950 Ib No Bid

Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 950 Ib No Bid

Midwest Turf Support, LLC 950 Ib No Bid

| 82 |Kentucky Blugrass

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
[ALT1] Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 150 Ib $3.50 $525.00 100% Kentucky BluegrassVarieties:40% ROCKSTAR35% QUARTZ25% APPALACHIAN Vista Seed Partnel

C.D. Ford and Sons Inc. 150 Ib $3.60 $540.00

[ALT1] River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 150 b $3.74 $561.00 Shortcut

United Seeds Inc. 150 |Ib $3.85 $577.50 Seed will be Blue Tag Certified. Cultivars will be Nuglade, Everest, Blue Note, Arrowt

D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 150 |Ib No Bid

Van Diest Supply Company 150 b No Bid

Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 150 |Ib No Bid

Midwest Turf Support, LLC 150 |b No Bid

| 83 |SuperTurfII

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
United Seeds Inc. 500 Ib $2.35 $1,175.00 Seed Will be Blue Tag Certified. Cultivars to be use in the mix are: 4th Millenium, Tit

[ALT1] River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 500 Ib $2.64 $1,320.00 Playground (80% tall fescue, 15% perennial ryegrass, 5% kentucky bluegrass

C.D. Ford and Sons Inc. 500 Ib $2.65 $1,325.00

Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 500 Ib No Bid

D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 500 Ib No Bid

Van Diest Supply Company 500 Ib No Bid

Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 500 Ib No Bid

Midwest Turf Support, LLC 500 Ib No Bid

| 84 |T1 Bentgrass

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 25 b $9.34 $233.50

United Seeds Inc. 25 Ib $11.25 $281.25

[ALT1] Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 25 lb $14.49 $362.25 Pure Distinction Tee2Green

D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 25 b No Bid

Van Diest Supply Company 25 Ib No Bid

Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 25 Ib No Bid

Midwest Turf Support, LLC 25 Ib No Bid

| 85 |Supershade

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
United Seeds Inc. 100 Ib $3.55 $355.00 Seed Will be Blue Tag Certified. Cultivars to be used are: Compass Chewing Fescue,
[ALT1] Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 100 b $2.45 $245.00 FANCY SHADE MIXVarieties:35% SILVERLAWN/KENT CRF20% ASHLAND KBG 15% Ag Vista Seed Partnel
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[ALT1] River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 100 Ib $2.89 $289.00 Shady lawn

D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 100 b No Bid
Van Diest Supply Company 100 Ib No Bid
Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 100 b No Bid
Midwest Turf Support, LLC 100 Ib No Bid

| 86 |Rescue Plus

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
[ALT1] Clesens (Clesen Holdings LLC) 100 Ib $1.94 $194.00 100% Tall FescueVarieties:34% Zig Zag TF 33% Tribute Il TF 33% Renegade DT TF

United Seeds Inc. 100 Ib $2.35 $235.00 Seed will be Blue Tag Certified. Cultivars to be used are: Summer, Siesta Turf Type T

[ALT1] River City Turf (Gold Star FS INC) 100 Ib $2.48 $248.00 Tough Lawn Tall Fescue

D & K Products (Century Homes Company) 100 b No Bid

Van Diest Supply Company 100 Ib No Bid

Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc 100 b No Bid

Midwest Turf Support, LLC 100 Ib No Bid
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