| 1 |Aluminum Sign Blanks

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 1 EA $5,084.00 $5,084.00
Vulcan Inc 1 EA $6,036.00 $6,036.00
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 1 EA $6,065.00 $6,065.00

| 1.1 |12" x 6" Rectangle 2 holes
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 50 EA $2.08 $104.00
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 50 EA $2.50 $125.00
Vulcan Inc 50 EA $4.18 $209.00

| 1.2 |48" x 36" Rectangle No holes
Supplier QTY UOoMm Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 100 EA $49.80 $4,980.00
Vulcan Inc 100 EA $58.27 $5,827.00
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 100  EA $59.40 $5,940.00

| 2 |Hardware

Supplier QTY UOoMm Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 1 EA $1,209.00 $1,209.00
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 1 EA $1,270.00 $1,270.00
Vulcan Inc 1 EA $5,833.84 $5,833.84

| 2.1 |Die Cuts Pressure Sensitive Red Arrow Double Headed, 7.5" x 2"
Supplier QTY UOoMm Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 100 EA $3.00 $300.00
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 100  EA $5.20 $520.00
Vulcan Inc 100 EA $21.60 $2,160.00 Packs of 5 EA

| 2.2 |Die Cuts Pressure Sensitive Red Arrow Single Headed, 7.5" x 2"
Supplier QTY UOoM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 100 EA $3.00 $300.00
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 100  EA $5.20 $520.00
Vulcan Inc 100 EA $21.60 $2,160.00 Packs of 5 EA

| 2.3 |Die Cuts Pressure Sensitive White Arrow Single Headed, 10" x 3"
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
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MDSolutions 25
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 25
Vulcan Inc 25

EA $3.00 $75.00
EA $5.40 $135.00
EA $43.20 $1,080.00 Packs of 5 EA

| 2.4 |Die Cuts Pressure Sensitive, non reflective, White, 6" Series B, 25 per package. Quantity for each letter: A- B- C- D- E- F- G- H- I- J- K- L- M- N- O- P-

Supplier Qry
Vulcan Inc 2
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 2
MDSolutions 2

uom Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
Package $20.96 $41.92 Price per pack
Package $23.75 $47.50
Package $36.00 $72.00

| 2.5 |Die Cuts Pressure Sensitive, non reflective, White, 6" Series B, 25 per package. Quantity for each number: 0- 1- 2- 3- 4- 5- 6- 7- 8- 9-

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
Vulcan Inc 2 Package $20.96 $41.92 Price per pack
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 2 Package $23.75 $47.50
MDSolutions 2 Package $36.00 $72.00

| 2.6 [NBA Aluminum Breakaway Nut 010-0470000
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
Vulcan Inc 2 Package $65.00 $130.00 Box of 100
MDSolutions 2 Package $85.00 $170.00
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 2 Package No Bid

| 2.7 [BOW 25 5/16" x 2 1/2" bolts 010-0370000
Supplier QTY UuUOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
Vulcan Inc 4 Package $55.00 $220.00 Box of 100
MDSolutions 4 Package $55.00 $220.00
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 4 Package No Bid

| 3 |Ready Made Signs Aluminum Blanks - High Intensity Prismatic

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 1 EA $6,968.25 $6,968.25
Vulcan Inc 1 EA $8,231.32 $8,231.32
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 1 EA $9,286.85 $9,286.85

| 3.1 [12" x 18" No Parking Symbol
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 200 EA $10.50 $2,100.00
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 200  EA $12.00 $2,400.00
Vulcan Inc 200 EA $14.96 $2,992.00
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| 3.2 |12" x 36" One Way — left arrow

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 13 EA $21.00 $273.00
Vulcan Inc 13 EA $23.08 $300.04
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 13 EA $25.40 $330.20
| 3.3 |12" x 36" One Way —right arrow
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 16 EA $21.00 $336.00
Vulcan Inc 16 EA $23.08 $369.28
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 16 EA $25.40 $406.40
| 3.4 [18" x 6" ALLWAY
Supplier QTY UOoMm Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 20 EA $5.25 $105.00
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 20 EA $6.00 $120.00
Vulcan Inc 20 EA $7.72 $154.40
| 3.5 [18" x 24" SLOW CHILDREN AT PLAY
Supplier QTY UOoMm Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 3 EA $21.00 $63.00
Vulcan Inc 3 EA $23.08 $69.24
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 3 EA $25.40 $76.20
| 3.6 [18" x 24" ONE WAY (LEFT)
Supplier QTY UOoMm Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 10 EA $21.00 $210.00
Vulcan Inc 10 EA $23.13 $231.30
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 10 EA $25.40 $254.00
| 3.7 [18" x 24" ONE WAY (RIGHT)
Supplier QTY UOoM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 10 EA $21.00 $210.00
Vulcan Inc 10 EA $23.13 $231.30
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 10 EA $25.40 $254.00
| 3.8 |24" x 30" SPEED LIMIT 20 (High Int. Prismatic)
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
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MDSolutions 5 EA $35.00 $175.00
Vulcan Inc 5 EA $38.55 $192.75
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta' 5 EA $42.60 $213.00
| 3.9 |24" x 30" SPEED LIMIT 35 (High Int. Prismatic)
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 10 EA $35.00 $350.00
Vulcan Inc 10 EA $38.55 $385.50
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 10 EA $42.60 $426.00
[ 3.10|24" x 30" SPEED LIMIT 45 (High Int. Prismatic)
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 10 EA $35.00 $350.00
Vulcan Inc 10 EA $38.55 $385.50
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 10 EA $42.60 $426.00
[ 3.1130" x 30" No Outlet
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 2 EA $43.75 $87.50
Vulcan Inc 2 EA $48.18 $96.36
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 2 EA $53.40 $106.80
[ 3.12{30" x 30" DO NOT ENTER
Supplier QTY UuUOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 5 EA S43.75 $218.75
Vulcan Inc 5 EA $48.18 $240.90
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta' 5 EA $53.40 $267.00
| 3.13[36” x 12” ONE Way Left
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 5 EA $21.00 $105.00
Vulcan Inc 5 EA $23.13 $115.65
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta' 5 EA $25.30 $126.50
| 3.14 [36” x 12” ONE Way Right
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 5 EA $21.00 $105.00
Vulcan Inc 5 EA $23.13 $115.65
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta' 5 EA $25.30 $126.50
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| 3.15 |12" x 18" Resident Parking Only Permit Required (see attachment)

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 20 EA $10.50 $210.00
Vulcan Inc 20 EA $14.18 $283.60
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 20 EA $27.00 $540.00

| 3.16 |12" x 18" No Parking symbol with From Corner under symbol
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 50 EA $10.50 $525.00
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 50 EA $12.00 $600.00
Vulcan Inc 50 EA $14.96 $748.00

| 3.17 |18" x 24" No Parking symbol with blank space under symbol
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 20 EA $21.00 $420.00
Vulcan Inc 20 EA $23.73 $474.60
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 20 EA $25.40 $508.00

| 3.18 |48" x 9" Double faced Green with White border
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
Vulcan Inc 25 EA $33.81 $845.25
MDSolutions 25 EA $45.00 $1,125.00
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 25 EA $84.25 $2,106.25

| 4 |Sign Posts

Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 1 EA $18,540.00 $18,540.00
MDSolutions 1 EA $27,826.50 $27,826.50
Vulcan Inc 1 EA $33,087.40 $33,087.40

| 4.1 |U-Channe| - Type B Steel; Galvanized (3#) 10 Ft.
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
Vulcan Inc 15 EA S45.66 $684.90
MDSolutions 15 EA $58.50 $877.50
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 15 EA No Bid

| 4.2 |Telspar - U S Gauge 12 (.105) - Galvanized 2.773#/Ft-4' x 2-1/4" x 2-1/4" .
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
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MDSolutions 100 EA $24.53 $2,453.00
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 100  EA $27.25 $2,725.00
Vulcan Inc 100 EA $29.60 $2,960.00
| 4.3 |Telspar - U S Gauge 14 - Galvanized - 9' x 1-3/4" x 1-3/4"
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 300 EA $32.40 $9,720.00
Vulcan Inc 300 EA $39.18 $11,754.00
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 300  EA No Bid
| 4.4 |Telspar - U S Gauge 14 - Galvanized - 10' x 1-3/4" x 1-3/4"
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 50 EA $36.00 $1,800.00
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 50 EA $38.90 $1,945.00
Vulcan Inc 50 EA $43.56 $2,178.00
| 4.5 |Telspar - U S Gauge 14 - Galvanized 2.416#/Ft. - 10' x 2" x 2"
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 200 EA $41.60 $8,320.00
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 200  EA $45.95 $9,190.00
Vulcan Inc 200 EA $49.61 $9,922.00
| 4.6 |Telspar - U S Gauge 14 - Galvanized 2.416#/Ft. - 12' x 2" x 2"
Supplier QTY UuUOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
MDSolutions 50 EA $49.92 $2,496.00
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 50 EA $53.05 $2,652.50
Vulcan Inc 50 EA $59.53 $2,976.50
| 4.7 |Telspar — U S Gauge 154 - Galvanized - 12’ x 1-3/4" x 1-3/4”
Supplier QTY UOM Estimated Price Extended Supplier Notes
lowa Prison Industries (lowa Sta 50 EA $40.55 $2,027.50
MDSolutions 50 EA $43.20 $2,160.00
Vulcan Inc 50 EA $52.24 $2,612.00 14 Gauge
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